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Abstract 
 
Purpose – This paper explores evaluation theory in a field closely related to corporate 
communication and public relations (PR) as well as in other disciplines and argues that embracing 
evaluation theory more broadly can break the “stasis” and “deadlock” identified in evaluation of 
corporate communication and PR. Specifically, this analysis seeks to show that a transdisciplinary 
approach can contribute to standards and demonstration of impact – two long-sought goals in 
evaluation of corporate communication and PR – as well as inform methodology.  
 
Design/methodology/approach – Critical analysis is applied to review evaluation theory in a 
number of fields including international development, public administration, management, and 
health communication, compared with major frameworks, models and methods used for evaluation 
of corporate communication and PR. 
 
Findings – This analysis shows that evaluation theory in other fields and related theory of change, 
program theory, and program logic models can contribute to advancing evaluation of corporate 
communication and PR in three ways: (1) identifying standards in terminology and approaches; (2) 
shifting focus from activities and outputs to outcomes and impact; and (3) applying appropriate and 
rigorous methodology.  
 
Research limitations/implications – While this paper does not present new empirical data, it 
expands the theoretical perspectives, models and methods applied to evaluation of corporate 
communication and PR and identifies new directions for research. 
 
Originality – As well as expanding evaluation theory and opening up new ground for research, this 
analysis identifies a need for structural change in the field of practice. 
 
Keywords – Evaluation, measurement, corporate communication, public relations 
 
Paper type – Conceptual paper 
 
Introduction – Three key challenges 
 
Measurement and evaluation (M&E), referred to as evaluation for brevity in this discussion, has 
long been recognized as an important and even essential part of the practice of corporate 
communication and public relations (PR). In a historical review of the field, Likely and Watson 
(2013) noted that evaluation has received intensive focus over the past 40 years. In a review of 10 
years of data collected for the European Communication Monitor, Tench et al. described evaluation 
as “the alpha and omega of strategy” (2017, p. 91). 
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However, despite four decades of research and industry debate, evaluation in the corporate 
communication and PR field has been described as being in a state of “stasis” (Gregory and Watson, 
2008; Macnamara and Zerfass, 2017), or even in a “deadlock” (Macnamara, 2015. Industry journals 
consistently discuss evaluation as a challenge facing corporate communication and PR practitioners 
(e.g., Comcowich, 2018). 
 
This critical analysis examines three key issues that are raised in discussion of evaluation and, 
drawing on a transdisciplinary literature review and a review of frameworks and models for 
evaluation of corporate communication and PR, presents conclusions and recommendations that 
offer a contribution to overcoming stasis in the field and advancing evaluation theory and practice. 
 
The first issue examined is what was optimistically described at the 2012 Summit on Measurement 
hosted by the International Association for Measurement and Evaluation of Communication 
(AMEC) in Dublin as the “the march to standards” (Marklein and Paine, 2012). Standards are 
applied in many professional fields and industries, as reflected in ISO 9000 standards for quality 
management and quality assurance (https://www.iso.org/iso-9001-quality-management.html) and 
the Global Reporting Initiative (GRI) standards for reporting on a range of economic, 
environmental and social impacts (https://www.globalreporting.org/standards). In corporate 
communication and PR, proponents of evaluation have advocated standards to help establish and 
maintain rigor, comparability and transparency. For example, Michaelson and Stacks (2011) 
reported that more than two-thirds of PR practitioners believe that standards for evaluation are 
necessary. Michaelson and Stacks noted that standards allow “comparative evaluations” over time 
and they ensure appropriate methods are used (2011, p. 4). However, despite a number of attempts, 
the so-called “march to standards” has floundered, as will be discussed. Analysis of evaluation 
literature in corporate communication and PR shows that, rather than moving towards standards, the 
field has gone down a path of ‘reinventing the wheel’ through frequent introduction of new terms 
and measures, rather than adopting widely used evaluation frameworks, models and methods.  
 
A second area of concern is that, when evaluation is conducted, studies have shown a short-term 
and narrow focus on measuring outputs such as media publicity (clips), advertising reach, social 
media posts, and website and video views, rather than outcomes or impact (Macnamara and Zerfass, 
2017; Schriner et al., 2017; Zerfass et al., 2015, p. 71). In particular, corporate communication and 
PR frequently fail to demonstrate outcomes and impact aligned to organizational objectives 
(Holtzhausen and Zerfass 2013; Volk and Zerfass, 2018; Zerfass, et al., 2017). Because corporate 
communication and PR have been unable to reliably identify outcomes and impact in many 
instances, practitioners have struggled to demonstrate their value. As Buhmann and Likely say, 
“value assessment is based on research that shows impact” (2018, p. 2). Buhmann et al. reinforce 
this need, stating: “the common objective of these frameworks is to move far beyond output metrics 
alone” (2018, p. 115). 
 
Third, the field has been found wanting in terms of methodological rigor, evidenced by the 
continuing use of methods such as advertising value equivalents (AVEs) by up to one-third of 
practitioners (USC & The Holmes Report, 2016); claims of return on investment (ROI) that are 
“loose and fuzzy” (Watson and Zerfass, 2012, p. 11), and automated ‘black box’ measures that are 
not transparent (Paine, 2014). 
 
PR theory and models in relation to evaluation also has been criticized by some scholars. Critiques 
include identification of an organization-centric focus on achieving functional and organizational 

https://www.iso.org/iso-9001-quality-management.html
https://www.globalreporting.org/standards
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objectives (Macnamara and Gregory, 2018) and a lack of focus on stakeholders’ and societal 
interests, as recommended by Grunig et al. (2002, 2006) and others. While Zerfass and colleagues 
have called for PR to closely align to organizational goals and objectives (Tench et al. 2017; Zerfass 
et al., 2017), this does not obviate the need for alignment to the organization’s stakeholders and 
operating environment, which corporate communication and PR theory identify as important 
(Cornelissen, 2011; Grunig et al., 2002).  
 
This paper presents a critical analysis based on a transdisciplinary literature review that offers a 
contribution to overcome stasis and deadlock in the field by identifying theoretical and practical 
pathways to advance towards standards in terminology and approaches, a focus on outcomes and 
impact, and the use of appropriate and rigorous methodology.  
 
For brevity, the terms ‘corporate communication’ will be used in the following discussion to include 
cognate fields such as communication management, strategic communication, government 
communication1 and, while acknowledging resistance to the abbreviation by some, public relations 
will be referred to from here as PR without any pejorative inference. 
 
The literature on corporate communication and PR evaluation 
 
Given the extensive debate in academic and professional literature over four decades, a detailed 
literature review of corporate communication and PR evaluation will not be repeated here. 
Comprehensive references for a history and review of developments in PR evaluation include 
Gregory and Watson (2008), Likely and Watson (2013), Michaelson and Stacks (2011) and Watson 
and Noble (2014). A broader review of evaluation of public communication including advertising 
and specialist fields such as health communication as well as PR is provided in Macnamara (2018). 
Corporate communication evaluation is discussed in a chapter on “research and measurement” in 
Corporate Communication: A Guide to Theory and Practice (Cornelissen, 2011), although this 
focusses predominantly on “measuring corporate reputation” (pp. 129–35) and “measuring 
corporate identity” (pp. 135–38). A study of corporate communication in Italian companies by 
Invernizzi and Romenti (2009) concluded that “the propagation of summative evaluation and in 
particular the use of business methods in the professional field to evaluate the results of 
communication is still very limited” (p. 118). They also noted that corporate communication 
evaluation is focused largely on quantitative performance measurement methods such as balanced 
scorecards and return on investment (ROI), even though such methods are reported to be poorly 
implemented or not applicable in many instances (Watson and Zerfass, 2011). Such comments 
further point to a need for further development of evaluation in corporate communication and PR. 
 
In this analysis, a number of widely published and promoted frameworks and models of evaluation 
for corporate communication and PR are examined. These are discussed in the following section for 
the purposes of comparison with theory, frameworks and models in other disciplines, which can 
inform evaluation of corporate communication and PR.   
 
Evaluation theory and models – Multidisciplinary perspectives 
 
Multidisciplinarity and transdisciplinarity2 are increasingly encouraged in scholarship, particularly 
in the social sciences in which disciplines such as psychology, sociology, cultural studies, 
phenomenology, and others inform each other as they often address the same problems and issues, 
but from different perspectives. According to Craig (2018), communication studies is an exemplar 



4 

of multidisciplinary and, increasingly, transdisciplinary scholarship, as the field has emerged out of 
studies of rhetoric, speech communication, mass communication, ‘Chicago School’ sociology, 
American cultural studies, and European literary, critical and cultural studies. Therefore, with 
corporate communication and PR grounded in the social sciences, and particularly in communication 
studies, transdisciplinary exploration is a logical and advisable strategy when encountering a 
problem for which a solution has not been found within a field. 
 
To that end, it is important to recognize that evaluation theory and models originated in the late 
1960s in public administration (Suchman 1967) and aid programs such as the early logical 
framework approach, also referred to as log frames, of the US Agency for International Development 
(USAID) (Practical Concepts, 1979). During the 1970s and 1980s a number of evaluation theories, 
models and methods were produced in international development, public administration, education, 
health services, and even in neighboring communication fields of practice such as health 
communication. 
 
Program theory and theory of change 
Evaluation theory is grounded in and derived from program theory and theory of change.  
Program theory was pioneered by Joseph Wholey (1979, 1983, 1987), a professor of public 
administration at the University of Southern California for more than 30 years, followed by Peter 
Rossi and one of his students, Huey Chen, who have championed the notion of theory-based 
evaluation (Chen & Rossi, 1983; Rossi et al., 2004). Other influential figures in developing program 
theory for evaluation include Leonard Bickman (1987) and Carol Weiss (1972, 1995, 1998). 
 
Wholey (1987) summarizes program theory as that which “identifies program resources, program 
activities, and intended outcomes, and specifies a chain of causal assumptions linking program 
resources, activities, intermediate outcomes, and ultimate program goals” (1987, p. 78). In a recent 
review, Davidson says that “program theory is simply a description of the mechanism by which a 
program achieves (or is expected to achieve) its effects” (2007, p. ix). Interestingly in terms of 
discussion later in this analysis, Davidson also argues that program theory and program theory 
evaluation (PTE) should not be restricted to measuring outcomes related to goals and objectives but, 
rather, should openly evaluate all effects including unintended side effects. 
 
Theory of change emerged from program theory in the mid-1990s as a way of analyzing initiatives 
that seek to create change and explain how change is achieved. Development was led by program 
evaluation researchers and initiatives such as the Aspen Institute Roundtable on Community Change 
(Anderson, 2005), and continues today through groups such as the Center for Theory of Change in 
New York (https://www.theoryofchange.org). In simple terms, theory of change focusses on 
identifying the short-term and mid-term changes that need to be achieved in order to produce longer-
term outcomes and impacts or, as one knowledge base on the subject says, “the causal processes 
through which change comes about” (Shapiro, 2005, para. 3).  
 
While program theory, which incorporates PTE, and theory of change initially were applied to 
evaluating the delivery of human and social services such as aid, health services and education, this 
knowledge has been progressively taken up in a number of other fields ranging from agricultural 
programs to large construction projects and contemporary management. Rossi et al. say that program 
evaluation based on program theory and theory of change is “useful in virtually all spheres of activity 
in which issues are raised about the effectiveness of organized social action” and specifically note 
its relevance for advertising, marketing, and other communication activities (2004, p. 6). 
 

https://www.theoryofchange.org/


5 

Program logic models 
The stages and elements of program theory are commonly explicated in program logic models, a 
graphic illustration of the processes in a program from setting objectives and pre-program planning 
to measurement of its outcomes and impact (Wholey, 1979). Widely used examples of program 
logic models for planning and evaluation are those of the Kellogg Foundation (2004) and the 
University of Wisconsin Extension program (UWEX) (Taylor-Power & Henert, 2008, p. 4). The 
Kellogg Foundation model breaks programs into five key stages referred to as inputs, activities, 
outputs, outcomes, and impact (see Figure 1.)  
 
Figure 1. A basic program logic model (Kellogg Foundation, 2004, p. 1). 

 

 
 
Some models identify up to seven stages in programs by breaking outcomes into short, medium, and 
long-term (see Figure 2). The UWEX Developing a Logic Model: Teaching and Training Guide 
notes that “many variations and types of logic models exist” (Taylor-Power and Henert, 2008, p. 2). 
The Kellogg Foundation similarly says that “there is no one best logic model” (2004, p. 13). 
However, there are a number of common concepts and principles in program logic models for 
evaluation. As well as identifying the logic of programs (i.e., which inputs and activities lead to the 
desired outcomes and impact), all program evaluation models emphasize that planning and delivery 
of programs begin with identification of SMART objectives and progress through stages. The most 
commonly used stages are described as inputs or resources, activities, outputs, outcomes and impact. 
Furthermore, program evaluation literature emphasizes that evaluation of outcomes and impact is 
most important – not simply evaluation of outputs. 
 
Figure 2. Program logic model proposed by Knowlton and Phillips (2013, p. 37) in their Logic Models Guidebook. 

 

 
 
Formative, process and summative evaluation 
As well as developing program logic models as a framework for evaluation, evaluation theory 
recognizes three types of evaluation – formative, process and summative (Rice and Atkin, 2013, p. 
13). Evaluation theory has long emphasized the importance of formative evaluation conducted 
before programs begin to gain understanding of audience interests, concerns, needs and preferences, 
as well as identify baselines for later comparison (e.g., existing awareness, attitudes and behavior). 
Process evaluation is proposed to inform fine tuning and adjustment of strategies, as well as provide 
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progress reporting. Very importantly, summative evaluation has been identified as a process for 
learning and program improvement (Bauman and Nutbeam, 2014), not simply reporting results and 
justification. Detailed analysis of program evaluation theory including program logic models and 
formative, process and summative evaluation strategies is available in a number of publications 
including Bauman and Nutbeam (2014), Macnamara (2018) and Rossi et al. (2004). 
 
Realist evaluation 
Another approach to evaluation, termed realist evaluation, adds two further key considerations to 
evaluation relevant to this analysis. Sometimes referred to as ‘realistic’ evaluation – a term that is 
mostly rejected because it suggests a narrow and simplistic approach focused on practicality – realist 
evaluation specifically turns attention to stakeholders and social context. Realist evaluation (RE) 
places emphasis on the context of programs and the interests of all ‘actors’ and influencers using 
context-mechanism-outcome (CMO) analysis as a methodology for evaluation (Better Evaluation, 
2016; Salter and Kothari, 2014).  
 
Health communication evaluation 
A field of communication closely related to corporate communication and PR that has adopted 
advanced forms of evaluation, and from which lessons can be learned, is health communication, also 
often referred to as health promotion. While planning and evaluation in this field were initially 
grounded in expectancy value theory and theory of reasoned action (Fishbein and Ajzen, 1975), 
which were based on individual rational thinking, contemporary approaches have adopted behavior 
change communication and, most recently, social and behavior change communication (SBCC), a 
social ecology model, and culture-centered approaches (Panter-Brick et al., 2006); Dutta et al., 
2013). These have embraced techniques from behavioral science including behavioral economics 
and, like CMO methods of realist evaluation, focus attention on the context of communication 
including stakeholders and social and cultural influences. 
 
In implementing evaluation, health communication extensively uses program logic models to plan 
and conduct formative, process and summative evaluation based on program theory and theory of 
change. Space does not permit a detailed review of health communication evaluation here, but this 
can be found in specialist texts such as Bauman and Nutbeam (2014). 
 
Public relations evaluation 
In comparison, over the past 40 years corporate communication and PR scholars and practitioners 
have developed a range of evaluation models that either ignored program evaluation in other 
disciplines or created their own variations. For example, the Cutlip, Center and Broom (1985) PII 
model, which has been presented in one of the most widely used PR textbooks through multiple 
editions, proposed evaluation at three stages called preparation, implementation and impact. While 
having merit in bringing attention to evaluation in PR, this model bore little relationship to program 
evaluation theory that was well-advanced at the time in other disciplines. Another widely-cited US 
model of PR evaluation developed by Walter Lindenmann (1993) also proposed three stages, but 
referred to these as outputs, outgrowths and outcomes. UK Institute of Public Relations3 evaluation 
consultant, Michael Fairchild, created what he called his “three measures”, which were output, 
outtake and outcome (1997, p. 24). Subsequently, Lindenmann (2003) expanded his model to four 
stages in which he adopted Fairchild’s notion of outtakes, but changed the stages to propose “PR 
outputs”, “PR outtakes”; “PR outcomes” and “business/organization outcomes” (pp. 4–7). UK 
evaluation specialists Noble and Watson (1999) also proposed four-stages, but called these input, 
output, impact and effect.  
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Meanwhile, in Germany the Deutsche Public Relations Gesellschaft (DPRG) – the German Public 
Relations Association – and the Gesellschaft Public Relations Agenturen – the German Association 
of Public Relations Agencies (GPRA) – began development of evaluation guidelines in the early 
2000s. These developments drew on management theory to incorporate the use of scorecards 
(Hering, Schuppener and Sommerhalder, 2004) drawn from Balanced Scorecards introduced in 
business in the 1990s (Kaplan and Norton, 1992) and the business concept of value creation (Lange, 
2005). Almost a decade of development involving practitioners and academics culminated in a four-
stage model made up of inputs, outputs, outcome and outflow, which was published by the DPRG 
and the International Controller Verein, a European association of business process controllers 
(DPRG/ICV, 2009; Huhn et al., 2011, p. 13). This model has become closely associated with the 
concept of communication controlling that has been promoted, particularly in Germany. 
 
The Integrated Evaluation Framework (IEF) developed by AMEC (2016) has been a significant step 
forward in evaluation of corporate communication and PR as it provides an interactive online tool, 
as well as an accompanying taxonomy of metrics and methods that apply at each stage (AMEC, 
2019). However, it retains outtakes – the stage introduced by Fairchild (1997) and later adopted by 
Lindenmann (2003) – to create six stages of evaluation. Also, this model restricts impact to 
“organizational impact” rather than impact per se – that is, it is focused only on identifying the extent 
to which an organization achieves its objectives, rather than considering outcomes and impact more 
broadly, including from the perspective of stakeholders and society.  
 
As recently as 2018, PR scholars published an evaluation logic model listing the stages as inputs, 
outputs, outtakes, outcomes, and outgrowths (Buhmann et al., 2018). This further deviates from 
established program evaluation literature by retaining two of the stages invented by PR practitioners 
(both Fairchild and Lindenmann were practitioners, not academic researchers). This model also 
reverses the order of outcomes and outgrowths from that proposed by Lindenmann (1993).  
 
To be fair, it has to be noted that the Buhmann et al. (2018) model, despite its inconsistent 
arrangement of stages of evaluation, does identify that evaluation should be conducted at multiple 
levels, listing product, campaign, program, society, individual and function as “units of analysis”. 
This supports and expands on the recommendation of the third and final PR Excellence theory text, 
which advocated evaluation at (1) program level; (2) functional level (e.g., department or unit); (3) 
organizational level; and (4) societal level (Grunig et al., 2002, pp. 91–2).  
 
An expanded focus in evaluation that more closely follows evaluation literature in other disciplines 
by proposing identification of outcomes and impact from the perspective of stakeholders, publics 
and society as well as the organization, including unintended as well as intended outcomes and 
impact, is available in Evaluation of Public Communication: Exploring New Models, Standards and 
Best Practice (Macnamara, 2018, p. 136). As well as being based on the classic program logic model 
stages of inputs, activities, outputs, outcomes and impact, this model recognizes the internal and 
external contexts of communication, which may change over time and which may necessitate 
adjustments in strategy, as noted in program theory and theory of change. Furthermore, it illustrates 
the two-way flow of information from stakeholders, publics and society to the organization, as well 
from the organization, and therefore the potential for organizational learning and change as well as 
learning and change among stakeholders and publics (see Figure 3).  
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Figure 3. Integrated model of evaluation (Macnamara, 2018).  
 

 
 
Nevertheless, most evaluation frameworks and models for corporate communication and PR vary 
substantially from evaluation theory, frameworks and models used in other disciplines. Specifically, 
despite corporate communication and PR theories emphasizing two-way interaction, relationships, 
engagement, dialogue and mutuality (Grunig et al., 2002, 2006; Taylor and Kent, 2014), most 
theories and models of evaluation in the field are organization-centric (Macnamara and Gregory, 
2018). That is to say, they focus narrowly on the goals and objectives of the organization, rather 
than a more open approach as recommended by Davidson (2007) Salter and Kothari (2014) and 
others. Second, few align to or use the program logic models applied in other disciplines, which 
focus on outcomes and impact beyond activities and outputs. Third, there is no consistent 
terminology, with a wide range of terms used for key concepts and processes. In short, there are no 
consistent or even emerging standards informing and guiding practice. 
 
A further illustration of the dislocation between evaluation theory and practice in other fields and 
corporate communication and PR is that two of the main contemporary books on PR evaluation – 
Evaluating Public Relations: A Best Practice Guide to Public Relations Planning, Research and 
Evaluation (Watson and Noble, 2014) and Primer of Public Relations Research (Stacks, 2011) –do 
not mention program theory, theory of change, or the other relevant theories and concepts discussed 
in this analysis. Similarly, the chapter on ‘Research and Measurement’ in Corporate 
Communication: A Guide to Theory and Practice by Cornelissen (2011) does not refer to evaluation 
theory developed and applied in other disciplines.  
 
Towards standards, impact and rigorous methodology 
 
Engagement with program theory, program evaluation theory, theory of change, tools such as 
program logic models, and methods of evaluation widely used in other disciplines can overcome the 
stasis and deadlock identified in relation to evaluation of corporate communication and progress this 
important field of practice in at least three ways. The following discussion seeks to identify how 
wider transdisciplinary engagement can facilitate standards, help show the value of corporate 
communication and PR by shifting focus to outcomes and impact, and ensure access to appropriate 
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methodology for such evaluation. In doing so, it opens up new directions for research and theory 
building in corporate communication and PR, as well as transformation of practice. 
 
A path to standards for evaluation 
Management and organization studies have identified the pathways and key steps in developing 
standards, or what some refer to as the process of standardization. In broad terms, standards fall into 
two categories: de jure standards that are enshrined in law or regulation with sanctions for breaches 
and de facto standards that are voluntary adopted, such as in best practice principles and codes of 
practice. Given that corporate communication and PR are not regulated fields of practice under 
statutes other than in a few countries, such as the UK in which the Chartered Institute of Public 
Relations (CIPR) operates under a Royal Charter that gives it powers to sanction, voluntary 
standards are the most widely applicable in corporate communication and PR. 
 
The body of literature on the process of standardization identifies three dimensions that contribute 
to the regulatory capacity of standards, whether they are de jure or de facto: (1) design, (2) 
legitimation and (3) monitoring (Slager et al., 2012, p. 765). These dimensions are enabled and 
supported by three types of what Slager et al. call “standardization work”, which they refer to as 
calculative framing, engaging, and valorizing (p. 764). 
 
Calculative framing includes defining and denotes the establishment of common terminology. This 
is aided by what standards literature refers to as mimicking and analogical work. Slager et al. say 
that “mimicking of pre-existing templates in the organizational field renders the new practices and 
standards that are promoted more understandable” (2012, p. 776). It also adds to their credibility. 
Mimicking in measurement and evaluation also commonly includes adopting existing legitimized 
indices, which contributes to overall legitimacy as well as credibility. Analogical work refers to 
highlighting conformity to existing templates or models (i.e., drawing analogies), although 
customization and innovation can be added (Slager et al., 2012, p. 776). 
 
The second type of standardization work advocated by Slager et al., and others (e.g., Brunsson and 
Jacobsson, 2000) involves engaging with relevant third parties including collaboration with experts 
and other organizations to access specialist knowledge and gain momentum through partnerships 
and affiliations. Engagement with experts further contributes to legitimation. The third type of 
standardization work, valorizing, includes educating potential adopters, promotion of standards, and 
symbolic initiatives such as awarding certificates or accreditation. 
 
All of these types of standardization work are relevant to evaluation of corporate communication 
and PR. Standards literature clearly suggests that calculative framing involving adoption of common 
terminology, mimicking, and conforming with other related disciplines and engaging with other 
relevant organizations are important and even necessary steps to establish credible, workable 
standards – even though deviation and customization can occur in future iterations as part of 
innovation. This indicates that corporate communication and PR evaluation scholarship and practice 
should start with and build on program theory, theory of change, widely used program logic models, 
frameworks such as realist evaluation, and theories of behavior change applied in fields such as 
health communication. Such an approach would bring standardization including simplification of 
terminology, credibility, and specialist expertise to evaluation of corporate communication and PR.  
Leveraging existing frameworks, models and knowledge would also contribute momentum in place 
of stasis and deadlock, as it would build on existing theory and models rather than ‘reinventing the 
wheel’.   
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Showing value through outcomes and impact 
Engaging with transdisciplinary literature on evaluation also would bring with it a shift of focus 
from activities and outputs, which have been the main concern in evaluation of corporate 
communication and PR, to outcomes and impact. This, in turn, would inform the search to show the 
value of corporate communication and PR. As Buhmann and Likely stated: “value assessment is 
based on research that shows impact” (2018, p. 2). 
 
In doing so, this approach leads to a number of questions about methodology. Evaluation of 
outcomes and impact requires appropriate methodology and methods – or, more specifically, 
methodology that has validity (i.e., it measures what it purports to measure) and reliability of 
quantitative methods, or credibility, dependability and overall trustworthiness in the case of 
qualitative methods (Lincoln & Guba, 1985; Shenton (2004). 
 
Developing methodology and capability 
Recent research shows the most common method of evaluation in corporate communication and PR 
continues to be collecting data on “clippings and media response”, followed by internet use statistics 
(Zerfass et al., 2015, p. 71–72). Often, as Grunig and others stated with concern, these are presented 
as ‘results’, when in fact they are measures of outputs, or what Davidson describes as “mechanisms 
by which a program achieves (or is expected to achieve) its effects” (2007, p. ix). Cutlip et al. warned 
as early as 1985 that in corporate communication and PR “the common error in program evaluation 
is substituting measures from one level for those at another level” (1985, p. 295). Grunig specifically 
warned that many practitioners use “a metric gathered at one level of analysis to [allegedly] show 
an outcome at a higher level of analysis” (2008, p. 89).  
 
To some extent, this substitution error is the result of a lack of knowledge among practitioners 
(Cutler, 2004; Grunig, 2014). But, in addition, review of the structure and capability of the corporate 
communication and PR evaluation industry, including professional organizations and service 
providers, shows that it does not have the expertise necessary for outcome and impact evaluation 
and it has not engaged with a number of third parties that could provide such expertise. 
 
For example, the two main global industry bodies representing this industry are the Federation 
Internationale des Bureaux d’Extraits de Presse (FIBEP) and AMEC, both of which are comprised 
mainly of corporate members that supply evaluation services. While both have rebranded themselves 
as ‘intelligence’ and ‘insights’ suppliers in recent times, their membership is almost entirely made 
up of media monitoring and media analysis firms as well as corporate communication and PR 
agencies. FIBEP’s membership originated, as its names indicates, from press clipping agencies and 
even today its website describes its services as “media monitoring, media analysis, PR distribution, 
journalist databases, as well as consulting services” (https://www.fibepcongress.com). Despite 
being the leading international body focused specifically on evaluation of ‘communication’, 
AMEC’s membership does not include any major market or social research companies such as Ipsos, 
Nielsen, GfK, or Kantar, which now includes the former TNS, Millward Brown, BMRB (the British 
Market Research Bureau) and IMRB (the Indian Market Research Bureau). Nor does it include 
major research institutes of which there are many with an interest in communication and media. 
 
Given that evaluation of outcomes and impact, such as awareness, attitude change and behavior 
change, requires quantitative and qualitative research such as audience surveys, interviews, focus 
groups and other social science research methods, the membership of the leading evaluation industry 

https://www.fibepcongress.com/
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body is not equipped to valorize, educate, or provide services based on appropriate methodology in 
relation to outcome and impact evaluation.  
 
Furthermore, the major industry bodies have not engaged to any significant extent with a number of 
expert third parties that could contribute knowledge and add credibility and legitimacy to their 
endeavors, such as academic researchers or business performance management (BPM) consultancy 
firms. AMEC appointed an Academic Advisory Group in 2016 to ostensibly advise the organization 
on evaluation policy and initiatives and expand its thinking about evaluation. However, while some 
members were involved in development of the AMEC Integrated Evaluation Framework and its 
accompanying resources, the group has been called on only occasionally for input, and final 
approval of all AMEC policies and initiatives rests with its board comprised of representatives from 
media analysis firms and corporate communication and PR agencies (see 
https://amecorg.com/about-amec/amec-international-board-members).  
 
Even though AMEC ‘Summits on Measurement’ have at times invited speakers from management 
consulting firms with expertise in BPM, AMEC’s membership and affiliations do not include any 
of the major consulting firms that increasingly advise organizations on performance management 
and performance measurement such as PriceWaterhouseCoopers, KPMG, Deloitte, or the Boston 
Consulting Group (BCG). Some may argue that these firms are outside the field of corporate 
communication and PR evaluation. Commercial trends show that such arguments are out of date. In 
2018, the European Commission contracted a consortium led by Deloitte in partnership with 
international development firm Coffey International, supported by survey research firm Ipsos and a 
university, to conduct evaluation of pan-European corporate communication campaigns – one of the 
biggest contracts for evaluation awarded by the EC.  
 
Chair of AMEC in 2018–2019, Richard Bagnall, is aware of the limitations of AMEC’s membership 
and its lack of engagement with the broader research industry, and he sees an expansion of 
membership and thinking as necessary in the industry’s peak bodies (R. Bagnall, perscomm. 27 
August, 2018). The retirement in 2018 of long-standing and respected CEO of AMEC, Barry 
Leggetter, afforded an opportunity for change. However, despite being highly regarded within 
AMEC and the US PR evaluation field, the newly appointed managing director, Johna Burke, also 
comes from a traditional PR and media background, most recently serving as chief marketing officer 
of BurrellesLuce. BurellesLuce describes itself on its website as “a provider of PR services to PR 
agencies, corporate communicators, and media relations managers” (Burrellesluce, 2018), with most 
of those services related to media relations, media monitoring and media content analysis.  
 
Conclusions 
 
This critical analysis acknowledges substantial efforts made by many academic researchers, 
practitioners, and industry bodies in a number of countries to develop evaluation for corporate 
communication and PR. However, it has pointed out major disparities between evaluation theory, 
models and approaches in corporate communication and PR, on one hand, and other major fields of 
practice such as development communication, health communication, as well as public 
administration and management in which a body of knowledge has been developed and applied 
more extensively and more effectively.  
 
This leads to a conclusion that evaluation of corporate communication and PR could be advanced 
considerably by engaging with evaluation literature in other disciplines. Specifically, such 

https://amecorg.com/about-amec/amec-international-board-members
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engagement could contribute to standards through adoption of common terminology, legitimized 
indices, and conformity with existing templates and models. Standards would, in turn, bring 
simplification, legitimacy, and credibility to evaluation of corporate communication and PR. This is 
not to rule out a case for innovation and customization for specific corporate communication and 
PR activities. But theory building should begin from the base of existing knowledge. Furthermore, 
contemporary scholarship advocates interdisciplinarity and transdisciplinarity (Bernstein, 2015). 
 
Second, it can be concluded that as long as evaluation of corporate communication and PR is focused 
on measuring activities and outputs such as media publicity and website clicks, it will be unable to 
demonstrate value. In arranging activities such as events and producing outputs such as media 
releases and website content, corporate communication and PR are a cost-center in an organization. 
Only when they can provide evidence of outcomes and impact can they lay claim to be a value-
adding function. As well as contributing to standards, engagement with the body of knowledge in 
other disciplines would bring an important shift in focus from activities and outputs to outcomes and 
impact of corporate communication and PR. 
 
Third, it can be concluded from analysis of the structure of professional bodies allegedly defining 
and valorizing evaluation of corporate communication and PR that they are mostly ill-equipped to 
promote and facilitate evaluation of outcomes and impact. This suggests that industry restructuring 
is required to access and apply the expertise necessary to evaluate outcomes and impact using valid 
and rigorous quantitative and qualitative methods. Restructuring could occur through expanded 
membership of industry bodies, partnerships, mergers with other organizations with complementary 
expertise, or advisory boards with active meaningful roles. Expertise is available among academic 
researchers, who can advise on methodology, and social and market research firms and business 
performance and management consultancies, which can conduct audience surveys, depth interviews, 
focus groups, ethnographic studies, and specialist research such as behavioral insights, cost-benefit 
analysis, cost-effectiveness analysis, and attribution modelling.    
 
These conclusions open up new directions for research, which could include transdisciplinary 
studies, exploration of case studies in other fields, and collaborative studies with evaluation 
specialists in other disciplines. Such research will substantially expand theory building in relation 
to evaluation of corporate communication and PR. These contributions, if complemented by 
structural change in the industry to expand capabilities, have the potential to overcome stasis and 
transform practice.  
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1  While some define corporate communication as apply only to corporations, many use the term broadly to refer bodies 
(corpora). For example, the European Commission refers to its major campaigns to promote the EU as ‘corporate 
communication’. 

2  Multidisciplinarity refers to drawing on and incorporating the perspectives of two or more disciplines and discussing 
these in parallel or contrast. Transdisciplinarity refers to scholarship that draws on multiple disciplines and, rather 
than presenting their respective views, synthesizes them to form new perspectives that are transformative and 
emergent, leading to new perspectives and knowledge beyond that of any participating discipline (Bernstein, 2015). 

3  Now the Chartered Institute of Public Relations (CIPR). 

                                                 

http://www.communicationmonitor.eu/
http://www.communicationmonitor.eu/

